
THIS DOCUMENT IS SUBJECT TO FINAL REVIEW BY THE CENTRAL PURCHASING DEPARTMENT AND SUBJECT TO FINAL AWARD BY CITY COUNCIL.

CITY OF FARMINGTON - BID ABSTRACT
SAND, GRAVEL AND FINES,  BID #12-90030     OPENING DATE: August 17, 2011

Consolidated Constructors, Inc. Four Corners Materials K.W. Enterprises, LLC
Public Works/Streets Division PO Box 629 PO Box 16 91 South Sky Lane Circle

Farmington, NM  87499 Farmington, NM  87499 Durango, Co 81303
Craig Murray Art Lopez Steven Winer
(505) 326-7771 (505) 324-3900 (970) 247-0886

CAT. ITEM QTY. DESCRIPTION Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 CATEGORY 1:  SAND

A 100 CY MORTAR SAND, MEETS A.S.T.M C-144-76 $25.00 $2,500.00 $24.30 $2,430.00 $25.00 $2,500.00
B 100 CY WASHED MORTAR SAND, MEETS A.S.T.M.C-144-76 $25.00 $2,500.00 $24.30 $2,430.00 $25.00 $2,500.00
C 100 CY DOUBLE WASHED MORTAR SAND, MEETS A.S.T.M. C-144-76 $25.00 $2,500.00 $29.30 $2,930.00 $32.00 $3,200.00
D 10 CY CONCRETE SAND, MEETS A.S.T.M. C-33 SECTION 4.1 $30.00 $300.00 $27.75 $277.50 $0.00
E 10 CY CONCRETE SAND/GRAVEL MIX $27.00 $270.00 $26.25 $262.50 $0.00
F 500 TON NO. 2 CONCRETE SAND $12.00 $6,000.00 $15.70 $7,850.00 $18.00 $9,000.00

IN-TOWN DELIVERY PER LOAD  
TEN YARDS OR MORE: $90.00 $110.00 $170.00
TANDEM (1-12) TONS: $70.00 $100.00 $170.00
SEMI:  TRUCK & PUP END DUMP, TRUCK & TRAILER END DUMP OR
TRUCK & TRAILER BELLY DUMP (12-22 TONS): $90.00 $110.00 $190.00

OUT-OF-TOWN DELIVERY PER LOAD
TEN YARDS OR MORE: $220.00 $220.00 $170.00
TANDEM (1-12) TONS: $200.00 $200.00 $170.00
SEMI:  TRUCK & PUP END DUMP, TRUCK & TRAILER END DUMP OR
TRUCK & TRAILER BELLY DUMP (12-22 TONS): $220.00 $220.00 $190.00

TOTAL BID CATEGORY- 1  SAND X $14,960.00 $17,140.00 * $18,260.00
 

TOTAL BID CATEGORY - 1 SAND WITH IN-STATE PREFERENCE $14,212.00 $16,283.00 $18,260.00
*Incomplete Bid

2 CATEGORY 2:  GRAVEL
  PEA GRAVEL, 3/8 WASHED AND SCREENED
A 20 TON NATURAL ROUND ROCK $22.00 $440.00 $22.10 $442.00 No Bid
B 200 TON 3/8" ROCK $12.00 $2,400.00 $14.65 $2,930.00 No Bid
C 20 TON 1/2" ROCK $14.00 $280.00 $11.95 $239.00 No Bid
  3/4' ROCK, MEETS A.S.T.M
D 40 TON C-33, SIZE NO.6 TABLE 2 $14.00 $560.00 $14.90 $596.00 No Bid
E 20 TON 1" ROCK $14.00 $280.00 $11.95 $239.00 No Bid
G 20 TON 2-1/2" MINUS LEACH ROCK $13.00 $260.00 $11.95 $239.00 No Bid
G 150 TON 1-1/2" ROCK $13.00 $1,950.00 $11.95 $1,792.50 No Bid
H 800 TON 3" ROCK $12.00 $9,600.00 $11.95 $9,560.00 No Bid
I 200 TON 6" ROCK $14.00 $2,800.00 $18.70 $3,740.00 No Bid

IN-TOWN DELIVERY PER LOAD  
TEN YARDS OR MORE: $90.00 $110.00 No Bid
TANDEM (1-12) TONS: $70.00 $100.00 No Bid
SEMI:  TRUCK & PUP END DUMP, TRUCK & TRAILER END DUMP OR
TRUCK & TRAILER BELLY DUMP (12-22 TONS): $90.00 $110.00 No Bid

OUT-OF-TOWN DELIVERY PER LOAD
TEN YARDS OR MORE: $220.00 $220.00 No Bid
TANDEM (1-12) TONS: $200.00 $200.00 No Bid
SEMI:  TRUCK & PUP END DUMP, TRUCK & TRAILER END DUMP OR
TRUCK & TRAILER BELLY DUMP (12-22 TONS): $220.00 $220.00 No Bid

TOTAL BID CATEGORY 2:  GRAVEL X $19,460.00 * $20,737.50 No Bid

TOTAL BID CATEGORY 2: GRAVEL WITH IN-STATE PREFERENCE $18,487.00 $19,700.63 No Bid
*Miscalculated by              
vendor as $17,126.50.  Affected 
the outcome of award as read at 
bid opening.



CITY OF FARMINGTON - BID ABSTRACT
SAND, GRAVEL AND FINES,  BID #12-90030     OPENING DATE: August 17, 2011

Consolidated Constructors, Inc. Four Corners Materials K.W. Enterprises, LLC
Public Works/Streets Division PO Box 629 PO Box 16 91 South Sky Lane Circle

Farmington, NM  87499 Farmington, NM  87499 Durango, Co 81303
Craig Murray Art Lopez Steven Winer
(505) 326-7771 (505) 324-3900 (970) 247-0886

CAT. ITEM QTY. DESCRIPTION Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
3 CATEGORY 3:  FINES

A 700 TON MANUFACTURED FINES $12.00 $8,400.00 $12.55 $8,785.00 $8.00 $5,600.00
B 10 TON NATURAL FINES $6.00 $60.00 $12.55 $125.50 $7.00 $70.00

IN-TOWN DELIVERY PER LOAD  
TEN YARDS OR MORE: $90.00 $110.00 $170.00
TANDEM (1-12) TONS: $70.00 $100.00 $170.00
SEMI:  TRUCK & PUP END DUMP, TRUCK & TRAILER END DUMP OR
TRUCK & TRAILER BELLY DUMP (12-22 TONS): $90.00 $110.00 $190.00

OUT-OF-TOWN DELIVERY PER LOAD
TEN YARDS OR MORE: $220.00 $220.00 $170.00
TANDEM (1-12) TONS: $200.00 $200.00 $170.00
SEMI:  TRUCK & PUP END DUMP, TRUCK & TRAILER END DUMP OR
TRUCK & TRAILER BELLY DUMP (12-22 TONS): $220.00 $220.00 $190.00

TOTAL BID CATEGORY 3:  FINES X $9,350.00 $9,870.50 * $6,730.00

TOTAL BID CATEGORY 3: FINES WITH IN-STATE PREFERENCE $8,882.50 $9,376.98 $6,730.00
IS BID SIGNED: Yes Yes Yes
IN-STATE PREFERENCE: Yes 19-C-23 Yes 74-R-30 No N/A
ESTIMATED APPLICABLE TAXES 7.125% 6.313% 7.125%
PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days  Net 30 days  Net 30 days  
DELIVERY: 1 calendar day  1 calendar day  Not Specified  

*Reject Bid- Gravel Yard
Exceeds 10 Mile Radius


