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CITY OF FARMINGTON - ABSTRACT SCHEDULE
BID: Herbicides, Insecticides, Fungicides, and Miscellaneous Chemical Supplies BID #12-91018 OPENING DATE: November 1, 2011 @ 2:00 PM

EST
ANNUAL
ITEM QTY

UOM

DESCRIPTION

WINFIELD SOLUTIONS
MACK BOSTICK

13411 HEADWATER LN
COLLEGE STATION, TX 77845

(979) 551-0507

UNIT

TOTAL

5% IN-STATE

PREFERENCE

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

BIDS DEPARTMENT
1385 E 36TH ST
CLEVELAND, OH 44114
(800) 321-5325 X 2550

UNIT TOTAL

5% IN-STATE
PREFERENCE

ADAPCO, INC.
KATHY RUSSELL
550 AERO LANE

SANFORD, FL 32771

(800) 367-0659

UNIT

TOTAL

5% IN-STATE

PREFERENCE

UNIVAR USA, INC.
LARRY WILLS
3301 EDMUNDS S.E.

ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87102

(505) 244-3530

UNIT TOTAL

5% IN-STATE
PREFERENCE

HERBICIDES

A 210

GAL

LIQUID, ROUND UP PRO, ACTIVE
INGREDIENT: GLYPHOSATE IN FORM OF
ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE
41%. INERT INGREDIENTS (INCLUDING
SURFACTANT), 2.5 GAL. OR 30 GAL
CONTAINER MONSANTO CO. OR EQUAL

*|$ 2625

$ 2,257.50

$

2,257.50

$ 1558 | $3,271.80

$

3,271.80

NO BID

$ 11.53($2,4421.30

$ 2,300.24

GAL

LIQUID, TRIMEC, ACTIVE INGREDIENT:
DIMETHYLAMINE SALT OF 2,4
DICHLOROPHENOXYACETIC 25.93%,
DIMETHYLAMINE SALT OF 2-(2-METHYL-4-
CHLOROPHENOXY), PROPIONIC ACID
13.85%, DIMETHYLAMINE SALT OF
DICAMBA, (3,6 DICHLORO-O-ANISIC ACID)
2.76%, 2.5 GAL CASE OR 30 GAL
CONTAINER, PBI GORDON CORP. OR

NO BID

$ 2660 (% 798.00

798.00

NO BID

$ 32.00($ 960.00

$ 912.00

C. 230

GAL

AMINE 400 2-4D, DIMETHYLAMINE SALE OF
2,4-DICHLOROPHENOXYACETIC ACID -
46.4% INERT INGREDIENTS 53.6%, 2.5 GAL.
CONTAINER, PBI GORDON OR EQUAL

*|$ 3945

$ 3,629.40

3,629.40

$ 20.60 | $4,738.00

4,738.00

NO BID

$ 15.65 | $3,599.50

$ 3,419.53

GAL

CURTAIL, CLOPYRALID: (3.6-DICHLORO-2-
PYRIDINECARBOXYLIC ACID) 7.5%; AND 2.4-
DICHLOROPHENOXYACETIC ACID 38.4% -
AS ALKANOIA MINE SALTS, OF THE
ETHANOL AND ISOPROPANOL SERIES,
INERT INGREDIENTS 54.1%, 2-2.5 GAL/CS,
DOW AGRO OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 151.01 | $3,020.20

3,020.20

NO BID

$ 3529 ($ 705.80

$ 670.51

GAL

GARLON 4 (4 LBS ESTER TRICLOPYR PER
GALLON), 2-2.5 GAL/CS, DOW AGRO- OR
EQUAL

*|$ 175.00

$ 700.00

700.00

$ 128.09 | $1,280.90

1,280.90

NO BID

$ 5412 ($ 541.20

$ 514.14

E. 420

LBS

KROVARI1-D.F., ACTIVE INGREDIENTS: 80%,
40% BROMACIL, 40% DIURON, INERT
INGREDIENTS: 20% , 6 POUND BAGS,
DUPONT OR EQUAL

*

$ 56.94

$ 3,985.80

3,985.80

$ 20.17 | $8,471.40

8,471.40

NO BID

$ 9.00 | $3,780.00

$ 3,591.00

oz

TELAR, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS:
CHLORSULFURON, 2-CHLORO-N-[(4-
METHOXY-6-METHYL-1,3,5-TRIAZIN-2-YL)-
AMINOCARBONYL],
BENZENESULFONAMIDE, 1 LB CONTAINER,
DUPONT OR EQUAL

*|'$ 280.00

$ 1,400.00

1,400.00

NO BID

NO BID

$ 13.82($1,105.60

$ 1,050.32
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H.

20

GAL

TORDON K, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS:
PICLORAM: 4-AMINO-3,5,6-
TRICHLOROPICOLINIC ACID, AS THE
POTASSIUM SALT, 2-2.5 GAL/CS, DOW
AGRO OR EQUAL

$ 193.25

$ 1,546.00

$

1,546.00

NO BID

NO BID

$ 50.00

$1,000.00

$

950.00

144

LBS

KARMEX DF, ACTIVE INGREDIENT: DIURON
[3-(3,4-DICHLOROPHENYL) -1,1-
DIMETHYLUREA], 4 LB CONTAINER, DUPONT
OR APPROVED EQUAL

*

$ 4035

$ 1,162.08

$

1,162.08

$ 1238 $1,782.72

$ 178272

NO BID

$ 4.71

$ 678.24

644.33

120

oz

ESCORT, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS:
METSULFURON METHYL {METHYL 2-[([[(4-
METHOXY-6-METHYL-1,3 5-TRIAZIN-2-YL)
AMINO]-CARBONYL]-AMINO]
SULFONYL]BENZOATE}, 8 OZ CONTAINER,
DUPONT OR EQUAL

$  49.68

$ 74520

745.20

$ 14.75 | $1,770.00

$ 1,770.00

NO BID

$ 3.47

$ 416.40

395.58

180

GAL

PRAMITOL 25E, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS:
PROMETON-2-4-BIS, (ISOPRUPYLAMINO 6-
METHORY-5-TRIAZINE) 25%, 2-2.5 GAL/CS,
MAKHTESHIM AGAN OR APPROVED EQUAL

NO BID

$ 40.09 | $7,216.20

$ 7,216.20

NO BID

$ 31.18

$5,612.40

5,331.78

186

LBS

SPIKE, 80W, ACTIVE INGREDITENTS:
TEBUTHIURON N-5-11, DIMETHYLETHY
THEODIAZOL, DIMETHYLUREA, 5 GAL
CONTAINER, DOW AGRO OR EQUAL

$ 96.84

$ 4,503.06

$

4,503.06

NO BID

NO BID

$ 16.47

$3,063.42

2,910.25

600

LBS

SAHARA DG , ACTIVE INGREDIENT:
IMAZAPYR (2-[4,5-DIHODRO-4-METHYL-4-(1-
METHYLETHYL)-5-OXO-1H-IMIDAZOL-2-YL]-3-
PYRIDINECARBOXYLIC ACID) 7.78%,
DIURON (3-[3,4-DICHLOROPHENYL]-1,1-
DIMETHYLUREA), 10 LB CONTAINER, BASF
OR EQUAL

$ 133.40

$ 8,004.00

$

8,004.00

$ 12.38 | $7,428.00

$ 7,428.00

NO BID

$ 9.12

$5,472.00

5,198.40

110

GAL

MOMENTUM, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS:
TRISOPROPANOLAMINE SALT OF 2,4-
DICHLOROPHENOXYACETIC ACID - 50.7%;
TRIETHYLAMINE SALT OF 3,5,6-TRICHLORO-
2-PYRIDINYLOXYACETIC ACID - 3.8%; 3,6-
DICHLORO-2-PYRIDINECARBOXYLIC ACID -
1.3%; INERT INGREDIENTS 44.2%, 2.5 GAL.
CONTAINER, LESCO INC. OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 44.85 | $4,933.50

$  4,933.50

NO BID

NO BID

50

LBS

PRODIAMINE 65 WDG - PRODIAMINE (CAS
NO. 29091-21-2) 65%, INERT INGREDIENTS
35%, 5 LB CONTAINER VEGETATION
MANAGER OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 1384 ($ 692.00

$ 692.00

NO BID

$ 1941

$ 970.50

921.98
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WINFIELD SOLUTIONS
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COLLEGE STATION, TX 77845
(979) 551-0507

UNIT

TOTAL

5% IN-STATE
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5% IN-STATE

UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE

P. 69

LBS

OUST 75% SULFOMETURON METHLY, 3 LB
CONTAINER, DUPONT OR EQUAL

*

$ 165.98

$ 3,806.04

$ 3,806.04

$ 113.82

$7,853.58

$ 7,853.58

NO BID

$ 3471($2394.99 8% 2,275.24

Q. 20

GAL

AQUA MASTER, ACTIVE INGREDIENT 53.8%
GLYPHOSATE

NON-IONIC SURFACTANT R-11 ACTIVE
INGREDIENT NONYLPHENOL
POLYETHOXYLATE (AQUATIC
SURFACTANT), 2 - 2.5 GAL/CS, MONSANTO
OR EQUAL

*

$ 36.40

$ 291.20

$ 291.20

$ 22.00

$ 440.00

$ 440.00

NO BID

$ 2371($ 47420 ($ 450.49

GAL

VISTA XRT, ACTIVE INGREDIEMTS FLUROX
1-METHYLHEPHLYL ESTER (4-AMINO-
3,50DICHLORO 6-FLUORO-2-PYRIDINYLOXY)
ACETIC 54.52%, 2 - 2.5 GAL/CS, DOW AGRA
OR EQUAL

*

$ 441.90

$ 4,419.00

$ 4,419.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

S. 10

GAL

NON-IONIC SURFACTANT R-11, ACTIVE
INGREDIENT NONYLPHENOL
POLYETHOXYLATE (AQUATIC SURFACTANT)
2 - 2.5 GAL/CS, OR EQUAL

$ 5235

$ 209.40

$ 209.40

$ 22.00

$ 220.00

$ 220.00

NO BID

$ 765|% 7650 (% 72.68

GAL

ORYZALIN 4 PRO - 3,5-DINITRO-N4N4-
DIPROPYLSULFANILAMIDE 41%, INERT
INGREDIENTS 59%, CONTAINS 4 POUNDS
OF ACTIVE INGREDIENT PER GALLON, 2.5
GAL CONTAINER, OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 56.12

$1,122.40

$ 1,122.40

NO BID

$ 4824 (% 96480 ($ 916.56

CASE

MILESTONE SPECIALTY HERBICIDE, 5
GAL/CASE, ACTIVE INGREDIENT
AMINOPYRALID 40.6%, OR EQUAL

$ 702.98

$ 1,405.06

$ 1,405.06

$ 2,691.54

$2,691.54

$ 269154

NO BID

NO BID

GAL

DOW AGRO CONFRONT, ACTIVE
INGREDIENTS: TRICLOPYR: 3,5,6-
TRICHLORO-2-PYRIDINYLOXYACETIC ACID,
TRIETHYLAMINE SALT 33%, CLOPYRALID 3,6
DICHLORO-2-PYRIDINECARBOXYLIC ACID,
TRIETHYLAMINE SALT 12.1%, OTHER
INGREDIENTS 54.9%, OR EQUAL

$ 120.73

$ 1,207.30

$ 1,207.30

$ 151.01

$1,510.10

$ 1,510.10

NO BID

$ 4588 (% 458.80 (% 435.86

20

GAL

BPI GORDON BENSUMEC 4 LF, ACTIVE
INGREDIENT BENSULIDE: S-(O,0-
DIISOPROPYL PHOSPHORODITHIOATE)
ESTER OF N-(2-MRCAPTOETHYL)
BENZENESULFONAMIDE 46%, INERT
INGREDIENTS 54%, OR EQUAL

$ 97.67

$ 1,953.40

$ 1,953.40

$ 12454

$2,490.80

$  2,490.80

NO BID

$ 97.65($1,953.00 % 1,855.35
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5% IN-STATE

UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE

X.

20

GAL

PBI GORDON SPEED ZONE, ACTIVE
INGREDIENTS: CARFENTRAZONE-ETHYL
.62%, 2,4-D,2-ETHYLHEXYL ESTER 28.57%,
MECOPROP-P ACID 5.88%, DICAMBA ACID
1.71%, INERT INGREDIENTS 63.22%, OR
EQUAL

*|$ 14765|% 1,181.20($  1,181.20

$ 86.06 | $1,721.20

$ 1,721.20

NO BID

$ 6294 ($1,258.80 (% 1,195.86

GAL

DOW AGRO RODEO, ACTIVE INGREDIENT
GLYPHOSATE N-
(PHOSPHONOMETHYL)GLYCINE,
ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT 53.8%, OTHER
INGREDIENTS 46.2%, 2.5 GAL CONTAINTER,
OR EQUAL

*|[$ 3500(%$ 70.00 | $ 70.00

$ 2200 ($ 110.00

$ 110.00

NO BID

$ 1382($ 6910(% 65.65

INSECTICIDES

10

GAL

SCOURGE, RESMETHRIN 18%, PIPERONYL
BUTOXIDE TECHNICAL 54%,

OTHER INGREDEDIENTS 28%, 5 GAL
CONTAINER, BAYER OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

$ 418.60

$4,186.00

$ 4,186.00

NO BID

110

GAL

BVA 13, 55 GAL. CONTAINER, OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

$ 9.89

$1,087.90

$ 1,087.90

$ 854 ($ 93940 (% 892.43

AB.

25

GAL

VECTOBAC 12AS, 2.5 GAL CONTAINER,
VALENT OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

$ 33.99

$ 849.75

$ 849.75

$ 3388(% 847.00($ 804.65

AC.

220

CY-KICK (Crack & Crevice) RESIDUAL, 11 LB
CYL CONTAINER, WHITMIRE OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 2891 $6,360.20

$ 6,360.20

NO BID

$ 1054 ($231880($ 2,202.86

AD.

CASE

TEMPO WP, BETA-CYFLUTHRIN TECHNICAL
11%, CRYSTALLINE SILICA (QUARTZ) 7.48%
BAYER OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 44742 ($ 89484

$ 894.84

NO BID

$ 365.10($ 730.20($ 693.69

AE.

40

GAL

KONTROL 30-30, PERMETHRIN 309%,
PIPERONYL BUTOXIDE TECHNICAL 30%,
INTERT INGREDIENTS 40%, 2 - 2.5 GAL
CONTAINER, OR EQUAL

NO BID

57.15 | $2,046.00

$  2,046.00

$ 9270

$ 3,708.00

$ 3,708.00

$ 81.35($3,254.00 | $ 3,091.30

AF.

CASE

BTI BRIQUETS, ACTIVE INGREDIENT 10.31%,
INERT INGREDIENTS 89.69%, 100
BRIQUETS/CS, OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 7930($ 79.30

$ 79.30

$ 69.75

$ 69.75

$ 69.75

$ 6625(% 6625(% 62.94

AG.

CASE

AGNIQUE MMF, 2 - 2.5 GAL/CS, COGNIS
CORP OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

$ 192.90

$ 385.80

$ 385.80

NO BID

AH.

DRUM

BVA LARVACIDE OIL 2, ACTIVE INGREDIENT
(HIGHLY REVINED PETROLEUM DISTILLATE)
97%, INERT INGREDIENTS 3%, 55 GAL
DRUM, OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 620.04 ($ 620.04

$ 620.04

$ 631.95

$ 631.95

$ 631.95

$ 59455 (% 59455 (8% 564.82
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5% IN-STATE

UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE

Al.

2

CASE

DEMAND EZ, SYNGENTA, 1/2 GAL 8 JUG PER
CASE, ACTIVE INGREDIENT
LAMBDA-CYHALOTHRIN 2.43%, OTHER
INGREDIENTS 97.57%, OR EQUAL

*

$ 10886 (% 1,036.32|$ 1,036.32

$ 643.20 | $1,286.40

$ 1,286.40

NO BID

$ 38118(3$ 76236 |% 724.24

AJ.

BAG

BAYER MERIT 75 WSP, 4 X 1.6 OZ PACKETS
PER BAG, ACTIVE INGREDIENT
IMIDACLOPRID, 1-[(6-CHLORO-3-
PYRIDINYL)METHYL]-N-NITRO-2-
IMIDAZOLIDINIMINE 75%, INERT
INGREDIENTS 25%, OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 106.95($ 534.75

$ 534.75

NO BID

$ 8456 (% 42280 (9% 401.66

FUNGICIDES

AK.

Cs

LIQUID,SCOTTS PRO-TURF, ACTIVE
INGREDIENT: IPRODIONE 19%,
THIOPHENATE METHYL 19.65%. ONE-HALF
(1/2) GALLON COVERS APPROXIMATELY
60,000 SQ. FT., 4.5 GAL/CASE, OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 24814 ($ 992.56

$ 992.56

NO BID

$ 32355($1,294.20 [ $ 1,229.49

AL.

Cs

FLUID FUNGICIDE II, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS:
16% TRIADIMEFON, 16% METALAXYL,
COVERS 2.07 ACRES - SCOTTS LIQUID OR
EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

AM.

30

GAL

DACONIL 2787 FLOWABLE FUNGICIDE.
ACTIVE INGREDIENT: CHLOROTHALONIL
(TETRACHLOROISOPHTHALONITRILE)
40.4%, INERT INGREDIENTS 59.6%,
SYNGENTA OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 3430 | $1,029.00

$ 1,029.00

NO BID

$ 3235($ 97050 ($ 921.98

AN.

Cs

CHIPCO 26019 FLO, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS:
IPRODIONE: 3-(3,5-DICHLOROPHENYL)-N-(1-
METHYLETHYL)-2, 4-DIOXO-1-
IMIDAZOLIDINECARBOXAMIDE 23.3%, INERT
INGREDIENTS 76.7%, 2 2.5 GAL
CONTAINERS/CASE, RHONE-POULENC AG
COMPANY OR EQUAL

*

$ 11563 |$ 92500 % 925.00

$ 855.74 | $3,422.96

$  3,422.96

NO BID

$ 32355($1,294.20 | $ 1,229.49

AO.

80

GAL

DACONIL ULTREX, TURF AND ORNAMENTAL
FUNGICIDE, ACTIVE INGREDIENT:
CHLOROTHALONIL
(TETRACHLOROISOPHTHALONITRILE)
82.5%, INERT INGREDIENTS 17.5%, 4 5GAL
CONTAINER/CASE, SYNGENTA OR EQUAL

NO BID

6.20 | $ 496.00

$ 496.00

NO BID

$ 582 (% 46560 (% 442.32
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AP. 4

Cs

HERITAGE, FUNGICIDE, ACTIVE
INGREDIENT: AZOXYSTROBIN: METHYL (E)-
2-{2-[6-(2-CYANOPHENOXY) PYRIMIDIN-4-
YLOXY] PHENYL} -3-METHOXYACRYLATE
50%, INERT INGREDIENTS 50%, 6 1LB
CONTAINERS/CASE, SYNGENTA OR EQUAL

$ 1,878.00

$30,048.00

$ 30,048.00

$ 1,878.00

$7,512.00

$

7,512.00

NO BID

NO BID

AQ. 10

GAL

SYNGENTA INSTRATA, CHLOROTHALONIL
(TETRACHLOROISOPHTHALONITRILE) CAS
NO 1897-45-6 29.9%, PROPICONAZOLE (CAS
NO. 60207-90-1) 4.7%, FLUDIOXONIL (CAS
NO. 131341-86-1) 1.2%, OTHER
INGREDIENTS 64.2%, 2.5 GAL CONT, OR
EOLIAl

*

$ 390.00

$ 1,560.00

$ 1,560.00

$ 156.00

$1,560.00

1,560.00

NO BID

NO BID

AR. 10

GAL

DACONIL WEATHER STIK,
CHLOROTHALONIL
(TETRACHLOROISOPHTHALONITRILE) 72%,
OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 56.50

$ 565.00

565.00

NO BID

$ 3235

$ 323.50

$ 307.33

AS. 10

LBS

PHOENIX PEREGRINE, ACTIVE INGREDIENT
CHLOROTHALONIL
TETRACHLOROISOPHTHALONITRILE 50%,
THIOPHANATE-METHYL DIMETHYL 4,4'-O-
PHENYLENEBIS (3-THIOALLOPHANATE)
16.66%, OTHER INGREDIENTS 33.34%, OR
EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

AT. 10

GAL

BAYLETON SYSTEMIC FUNGICIDE IN WATER
SOLUBLE PACKETS, 4 X 5.5 OZ PACKETS
PER BAG, ACTIVE INGREDIENT 1-(4-
CHLOROPHENOXY)-3,3-DIMETHYL-1-(1H-
1,2,4-TRIAZOL-1-YL)-2-BUTANONE 25%,
INERT INGREDIENTS 75 %, OR EQUAL

$ 80.77

$ 807.70

$ 807.70

$ 200.27

$2,002.70

2,002.70

NO BID

$ 143.72

$1,437.20

$ 1,365.34

GAL

CROMPTON TURFSIDE, ACTIVE
INGREDIENT
PENTACHLORONITROBENZENE 10%, INERT
INGREDIENTS 90%, OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

MISCELLANEOUS

AV. 175

GAL

PRIME OIL, 83% PARAFYNE BASE
PETROLEUM ALSO KNOWN AS
SURFACTANT 2.5 GAL CONTAINER, (NO 5
GAL. CONTAINERS), OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

AW. 50

PKG

SPRAY COLORANT WATER SOLUBLE
PACKS FOR USE IN CHEMICAL MIXES .
(1PKG TO MIX APPROXIMATELY 50-150
GALLON TANKS) PBI GORDON OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 3.19

$ 159.50

159.50

NO BID

*|1$ 176.47

$ 176.47

$ 167.65




THIS DOCUMENT IS SUBJECT TO FINAL REVIEW BY THE CENTRAL PURCHASING DEPARTMENT AND SUBJECT TO FINAL AWARD BY CITY COUNCIL.

CITY OF FARMINGTON - ABSTRACT SCHEDULE
BID: Herbicides, Insecticides, Fungicides, and Miscellaneous Chemical Supplies BID #12-91018 OPENING DATE: November 1, 2011 @ 2:00 PM

EST
ANNUAL
ITEM QTY

UOM

DESCRIPTION

UNIT

WINFIELD SOLUTIONS
MACK BOSTICK
13411 HEADWATER LN
COLLEGE STATION, TX 77845
(979) 551-0507

TOTAL

5% IN-STATE
PREFERENCE

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
BIDS DEPARTMENT

1385 E 36TH ST
CLEVELAND, OH 44114
(800) 321-5325 X 2550

5% IN-STATE

UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE

ADAPCO, INC.
KATHY RUSSELL
550 AERO LANE

SANFORD, FL 32771
(800) 367-0659

UNIT

TOTAL

5% IN-STATE

PREFERENCE

UNIVAR USA, INC.

LARRY WILLS

3301 EDMUNDS S.E.
ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87102

(505) 244-3530

UNIT

TOTAL

5% IN-STATE
PREFERENCE

AX. 2

GAL

SYNGENTA TRIMMIT 2SC, ACTIVE
INGREDIENT PACLOBUTRAZOL 22.3%,
OTHER INGREDIENTS 77.7%, 1 GAL CONT,
OR EQUAL

$ 44719 | $

894.38

$ 894.38

$ 59226 |$1,18452 | $ 1,184.52

NO BID

NO BID

AY. 2

GAL

SYNGENTA PRIMO MAXX, ACTIVE
INGREDIENT TRINEXAPAC-ETHYL (CAS NO.
95266-40-3) 11.3%, OTHER INGREDIENTS

$ 279.00 | $

558.00

$ 558.00

$ 23016 |$ 460.32|$ 460.32

NO BID

NO BID

AZ. 2

GAL

ANDERSONS GOLF PRODUCTS TURF
ENHANCER 2SC, OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

BA. 20

GAL

BAYER PROXY GROTH REGULATOR,
ACTIVE INGREDIENT ETHEPHON [(2-
CHLOROETHYL) PHOSPHONIC ACID] 21.7%,
OTHER INGREDIENT 78.3%, OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 138.40($2,768.00|$ 2,768.00

NO BID

$ 4353

$ 870.60 | $

827.07

BB. 55

GAL

SOIL WETTING AGENT FOR TURF, WETTING
AGENT. ACTIVE INGREDIENT: FERMENT
25%, CARRIER 70.5%, LINEAR PRIMARY
ALCOHOL ETHAYLATE, FATTY ACID
ETHATLATE 4.5%, SODIUM FARRAYL
SULFATE, OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

BC. 30

GAL

HI-LIGHT LIQUID, PRODUCT CODE: HL.LIQ,
2.5 GAL (NO 5 GAL OR QUART CONTAINERS)
BECKER-UNDERWOOD INC. OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 2004|% 60120 % 601.20

NO BID

$ 30.28

$ 908.40 ($

862.98

BD. 100

GAL

SUNPAR 107 (MINERAL OIL), OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

$ 989 | $

989.00

$ 989.00

$ 8.54

$ 854.00 $

811.30

BE. 55

GAL

FERROMEC AC LIQUID IRON 15-00,
GUARANTEED ANALYSIS = 15% UREA
NITROGEN, SULFUR 3%, IRON 6% 2.5 GAL,
30 GAL, OR 55 GAL CONTAINER, PBI
GORDON OR EQUAL

$ 40955 |$

409.55

$ 409.55

$ 757|$ 41635 |$ 416.35

NO BID

$ 8.53

$ 469.15($

445.69

BF. 5

CASE

SCOTTS PRO TURF, TURF ENHANCER 2SC,
2 640Z CONTAINERS/CASE, OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

BG. 40

BAG

SCOTTS, HIGH K FERTILIZER PLUS, TURF
ENHANCER 15-0-29, OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 29.65|%$1,186.00 | $ 1,186.00

NO BID

NO BID

SIGNED:

YES

YES

YES

YES

IN-STATE PREFERENCE:

NO

NO

NO

YES 28R24

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET 30

NET 30

NET 30

NET 30

DELIVERY:

7 CAL DAYS

7-10 CAL DAYS

2-3 CAL DAYS

7 CAL DAYS

ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED:

YES

YES

1 OF 3 ACK

1 OF 3 ACK

exceptions to unit of measure

exceptions to unit of measure

* exceptions to unit of measure




THIS DOCUMENT IS SUBJECT TO FINAL REVIEW I

CITY OF FARMINGTON - ABSTRACT SCHEDULE
BID: Herbicides, Insecticides, Fungicides, and Miscellaneous C

HELENA CHEMICAL CO. RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC. CLARKE MOSQUITO PRODUCTS, INC.
DAN BLAESER LARRY MAULDIN DOUG CARROLL
8905 ADAMS NE PO BOX 226 110 E IRVING PARK RD. 4TH FLOOR
ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87113 HARPER, TX 78631 ROSELLE, IL 60172
(505) 797-5800 (830) 864-5363 (800) 323-5727

EST
ANNUAL 5% IN-STATE 5% IN-STATE 5% IN-STATE
ITEM QTY UOM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE
HERBICIDES
A. 210[GAL |LIQUID, ROUND UP PRO, ACTIVE $ 12.45 [ $2,614.50 | $ 2,483.78 $ 12.25 [ $2,572.50 | $ 2,572.50 NO BID

INGREDIENT: GLYPHOSATE IN FORM OF
ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE
41%. INERT INGREDIENTS (INCLUDING
SURFACTANT), 2.5 GAL. OR 30 GAL
CONTAINER MONSANTO CO. OR EQUAL

B. 30|GAL  |LIQUID, TRIMEC, ACTIVE INGREDIENT: $ 28.00 [ $ 840.00 | $ 798.00 $ 20.00 [ $ 600.00 | $ 600.00 NO BID
DIMETHYLAMINE SALT OF 2,4

DICHLOROPHENOXYACETIC 25.93%,
DIMETHYLAMINE SALT OF 2-(2-METHYL-4-
CHLOROPHENOXY), PROPIONIC ACID
13.85%, DIMETHYLAMINE SALT OF
DICAMBA, (3,6 DICHLORO-O-ANISIC ACID)
2.76%, 2.5 GAL CASE OR 30 GAL
CONTAINER, PBI GORDON CORP. OR

C. 230|GAL  (AMINE 400 2-4D, DIMETHYLAMINE SALE OF $ 16.90 | $3,887.00 | $ 3,692.65 $ 15.00 | $3,450.00 | $ 3,450.00 NO BID
2,4-DICHLOROPHENOXYACETIC ACID -

46.4% INERT INGREDIENTS 53.6%, 2.5 GAL.
CONTAINER, PBI GORDON OR EQUAL

D. 20[GAL |CURTAIL, CLOPYRALID: (3.6-DICHLORO-2- NO BID $  150.00 | $3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 NO BID
PYRIDINECARBOXYLIC ACID) 7.5%; AND 2.4-
DICHLOROPHENOXYACETIC ACID 38.4% -
AS ALKANOIA MINE SALTS, OF THE
ETHANOL AND ISOPROPANOL SERIES,
INERT INGREDIENTS 54.1%, 2-2.5 GAL/CS,
DOW AGRO OR EQUAL

E. 10|GAL [GARLON 4 (4 LBS ESTER TRICLOPYR PER $ 79.00 [ $ 790.00 | $ 750.50 $ 5950 [ $ 595.00 | $ 595.00 NO BID
GALLON), 2-2.5 GAL/CS, DOW AGRO- OR
EQUAL

F. 420|LBS |KROVARL-D.F., ACTIVE INGREDIENTS: 80%, $ 12.65 | $5,313.00 | $ 5,047.35 $ 10.18 | $4,275.60 | $ 4,275.60 NO BID

40% BROMACIL, 40% DIURON, INERT
INGREDIENTS: 20% , 6 POUND BAGS,
DUPONT OR EQUAL

G. 80|0Z  [TELAR, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS: $ 15.50 | $1,240.00 | $ 1,178.00 $ 16.00 | $1,280.00 | $ 1,280.00 NO BID
CHLORSULFURON, 2-CHLORO-N-[(4-
METHOXY-6-METHYL-1,3,5-TRIAZIN-2-YL)-
AMINOCARBONYL],
BENZENESULFONAMIDE, 1 LB CONTAINER,
DUPONT OR EQUAL




THIS DOCUMENT IS SUBJECT TO FINAL REVIEW I

CITY OF FARMINGTON - ABSTRACT SCHEDULE

BID: Herbicides, Insecticides, Fungicides, and Miscellaneous C

ITEM QTY

EST
ANNUAL
UOM

DESCRIPTION

HELENA CHEMICAL CO.
DAN BLAESER

8905 ADAMS NE
ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87113
(505) 797-5800

UNIT TOTAL

5% IN-STATE
PREFERENCE

RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC.
LARRY MAULDIN

PO BOX 226

HARPER, TX 78631

(830) 864-5363

5% IN-STATE

UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE

CLARKE MOSQUITO PRODUCTS, INC.
DOUG CARROLL

110 E IRVING PARK RD. 4TH FLOOR
ROSELLE, IL 60172

(800) 323-5727

5% IN-STATE

UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE

H.

20({GAL

TORDON K, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS:
PICLORAM: 4-AMINO-3,5,6-
TRICHLOROPICOLINIC ACID, AS THE
POTASSIUM SALT, 2-2.5 GAL/CS, DOW
AGRO OR EQUAL

$ 48.00 | $ 960.00

$ 912.00

$ 82.00 | $1,640.00 | $ 1,640.00

NO BID

144|LBS

KARMEX DF, ACTIVE INGREDIENT: DIURON
[3-(3,4-DICHLOROPHENYL) -1,1-
DIMETHYLUREA], 4 LB CONTAINER, DUPONT
OR APPROVED EQUAL

$ 3.50 | $ 504.00

$ 478.80

$ 520|$ 74880 (% 748.80

NO BID

120|0z

ESCORT, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS:
METSULFURON METHYL {METHYL 2-[([[(4-
METHOXY-6-METHYL-1,3 5-TRIAZIN-2-YL)
AMINO]-CARBONYL]-AMINO]
SULFONYL]BENZOATE}, 8 OZ CONTAINER,
DUPONT OR EQUAL

$ 4.40 [ $ 528.00

$ 501.60

$ 295|% 354.00 (% 354.00

NO BID

180|GAL

PRAMITOL 25E, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS:
PROMETON-2-4-BIS, (ISOPRUPYLAMINO 6-
METHORY-5-TRIAZINE) 25%, 2-2.5 GAL/CS,
MAKHTESHIM AGAN OR APPROVED EQUAL

$ 29.40 | $5,292.00

$ 5,027.40

$ 31.80 | $5,724.00 | $ 5,724.00

NO BID

186|LBS

SPIKE, 80W, ACTIVE INGREDITENTS:
TEBUTHIURON N-5-11, DIMETHYLETHY
THEODIAZOL, DIMETHYLUREA, 5 GAL
CONTAINER, DOW AGRO OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 19.10 | $3,552.60 | $ 3,552.60

NO BID

600|LBS

SAHARA DG , ACTIVE INGREDIENT:
IMAZAPYR (2-[4,5-DIHODRO-4-METHYL-4-(1-
METHYLETHYL)-5-OXO-1H-IMIDAZOL-2-YL]-3-
PYRIDINECARBOXYLIC ACID) 7.78%,
DIURON (3-[3,4-DICHLOROPHENYL]-1,1-
DIMETHYLUREA), 10 LB CONTAINER, BASF
OR EQUAL

$ 11.20 | $6,720.00

$ 6,384.00

$ 10.00 | $6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00

NO BID

110|GAL

MOMENTUM, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS:
TRISOPROPANOLAMINE SALT OF 2,4-
DICHLOROPHENOXYACETIC ACID - 50.7%;
TRIETHYLAMINE SALT OF 3,5,6-TRICHLORO-
2-PYRIDINYLOXYACETIC ACID - 3.8%; 3,6-
DICHLORO-2-PYRIDINECARBOXYLIC ACID -
1.3%; INERT INGREDIENTS 44.2%, 2.5 GAL.
CONTAINER, LESCO INC. OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

50(LBS

PRODIAMINE 65 WDG - PRODIAMINE (CAS
NO. 29091-21-2) 65%, INERT INGREDIENTS
35%, 5 LB CONTAINER VEGETATION
MANAGER OR EQUAL

$ 11.92 [ $ 596.00

$ 566.20

$ 1249 |$ 62450 $ 624.50

NO BID




THIS DOCUMENT IS SUBJECT TO FINAL REVIEW I

CITY OF FARMINGTON - ABSTRACT SCHEDULE
BID: Herbicides, Insecticides, Fungicides, and Miscellaneous C

EST

ANNUAL

ITEM QTY

UOM

DESCRIPTION

UNIT

HELENA CHEMICAL CO.
DAN BLAESER

8905 ADAMS NE
ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87113
(505) 797-5800

TOTAL

5% IN-STATE
PREFERENCE

RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC.

LARRY MAULDIN

PO BOX 226
HARPER, TX 78631
(830) 864-5363

UNIT

TOTAL

5% IN-STATE
PREFERENCE

CLARKE MOSQUITO PRODUCTS, INC.
DOUG CARROLL

110 E IRVING PARK RD. 4TH FLOOR
ROSELLE, IL 60172

(800) 323-5727

5% IN-STATE

UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE

P.

69

LBS

*

OUST 75% SULFOMETURON METHLY, 3 LB
CONTAINER, DUPONT OR EQUAL

2.60

$2,870.40

$

2,726.88

$

27.94

$1,927.86

$

1,927.86

NO BID

Q.

20

GAL

AQUA MASTER, ACTIVE INGREDIENT 53.8%
GLYPHOSATE

NON-IONIC SURFACTANT R-11 ACTIVE
INGREDIENT NONYLPHENOL
POLYETHOXYLATE (AQUATIC
SURFACTANT), 2 - 2.5 GAL/CS, MONSANTO
OR EQUAL

12.69

$ 253.80

$

241.11

13.97

$ 279.40

$

279.40

NO BID

25

GAL

VISTA XRT, ACTIVE INGREDIEMTS FLUROX
1-METHYLHEPHLYL ESTER (4-AMINO-
3,50DICHLORO 6-FLUORO-2-PYRIDINYLOXY)
ACETIC 54.52%, 2 - 2.5 GAL/CS, DOW AGRA
OR EQUAL

165.00

$4,125.00

3,918.75

185.00

$ 4,625.00

4,625.00

NO BID

10

GAL

NON-IONIC SURFACTANT R-11, ACTIVE
INGREDIENT NONYLPHENOL
POLYETHOXYLATE (AQUATIC SURFACTANT)
2 - 2.5 GAL/CS, OR EQUAL

20.00

$ 200.00

190.00

7.95

$ 79.50

79.50

NO BID

20

GAL

ORYZALIN 4 PRO - 3,5-DINITRO-N4N4-
DIPROPYLSULFANILAMIDE 41%, INERT
INGREDIENTS 59%, CONTAINS 4 POUNDS
OF ACTIVE INGREDIENT PER GALLON, 2.5
GAL CONTAINER, OR EQUAL

49.00

$ 980.00

931.00

44.00

$ 880.00

880.00

NO BID

CASE

MILESTONE SPECIALTY HERBICIDE, 5 *
GAL/CASE, ACTIVE INGREDIENT
AMINOPYRALID 40.6%, OR EQUAL

275.00

$1,375.00

1,306.25

*
&

299.73

$1,498.65

1,498.65

NO BID

10

GAL

DOW AGRO CONFRONT, ACTIVE
INGREDIENTS: TRICLOPYR: 3,5,6-
TRICHLORO-2-PYRIDINYLOXYACETIC ACID,
TRIETHYLAMINE SALT 33%, CLOPYRALID 3,6
DICHLORO-2-PYRIDINECARBOXYLIC ACID,
TRIETHYLAMINE SALT 12.1%, OTHER
INGREDIENTS 54.9%, OR EQUAL

NO BID

105.00

$1,050.00

1,050.00

NO BID

20

GAL

BPI GORDON BENSUMEC 4 LF, ACTIVE
INGREDIENT BENSULIDE: S-(O,0-
DIISOPROPYL PHOSPHORODITHIOATE)
ESTER OF N-(2-MRCAPTOETHYL)
BENZENESULFONAMIDE 46%, INERT
INGREDIENTS 54%, OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID




THIS DOCUMENT IS SUBJECT TO FINAL REVIEW I

CITY OF FARMINGTON - ABSTRACT SCHEDULE
BID: Herbicides, Insecticides, Fungicides, and Miscellaneous C

HELENA CHEMICAL CO. RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC. CLARKE MOSQUITO PRODUCTS, INC.
DAN BLAESER LARRY MAULDIN DOUG CARROLL
8905 ADAMS NE PO BOX 226 110 E IRVING PARK RD. 4TH FLOOR
ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87113 HARPER, TX 78631 ROSELLE, IL 60172
(505) 797-5800 (830) 864-5363 (800) 323-5727
EST

ANNUAL 5% IN-STATE 5% IN-STATE 5% IN-STATE

ITEM QTY UOM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE

X. 20(GAL [PBI GORDON SPEED ZONE, ACTIVE NO BID $ 75.00 | $1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 NO BID
INGREDIENTS: CARFENTRAZONE-ETHYL
.62%, 2,4-D,2-ETHYLHEXYL ESTER 28.57%,
MECOPROP-P ACID 5.88%, DICAMBA ACID
1.71%, INERT INGREDIENTS 63.22%, OR
EQUAL

Y. 5/GAL |DOW AGRO RODEO, ACTIVE INGREDIENT NO BID $ 1397 |$ 69.85]|$ 69.85 NO BID
GLYPHOSATE N-
(PHOSPHONOMETHYL)GLYCINE,
ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT 53.8%, OTHER
INGREDIENTS 46.2%, 2.5 GAL CONTAINTER,
OR EQUAL

INSECTICIDES

Z 10[GAL |SCOURGE, RESMETHRIN 18%, PIPERONYL NO BID NO BID NO BID
BUTOXIDE TECHNICAL 54%,

OTHER INGREDEDIENTS 28%, 5 GAL
CONTAINER, BAYER OR EQUAL

AA. 110|GAL  |BVA 13, 55 GAL. CONTAINER, OR EQUAL NO BID NO BID * |$ 41250|$ 825.00|% 825.00

AB. 25(GAL  [VECTOBAC 12AS, 2.5 GAL CONTAINER, NO BID NO BID $ 16225|% 811.25|$%$ 811.25
VALENT OR EQUAL

AC. 220|1B CY-KICK (Crack & Crevice) RESIDUAL, 11 LB NO BID NO BID NO BID
CYL CONTAINER, WHITMIRE OR EQUAL

AD. 2|CASE [TEMPO WP, BETA-CYFLUTHRIN TECHNICAL NO BID NO BID NO BID
11%, CRYSTALLINE SILICA (QUARTZ) 7.48%
BAYER OR EQUAL

AE. 40|GAL  |KONTROL 30-30, PERMETHRIN 30%, NO BID NO BID * |$ 600.00|$4,800.00|$ 4,800.00
PIPERONYL BUTOXIDE TECHNICAL 30%,
INTERT INGREDIENTS 40%, 2 - 2.5 GAL
CONTAINER, OR EQUAL

AF. 1[CASE [BTI BRIQUETS, ACTIVE INGREDIENT 10.31%, NO BID NO BID $ 75.00($ 75.00|% 75.00
INERT INGREDIENTS 89.69%, 100
BRIQUETS/CS, OR EQUAL

AG. 2|CASE |AGNIQUE MMF, 2 - 2.5 GAL/CS, COGNIS NO BID NO BID NO BID
CORP OR EQUAL

AH. 1|DRUM |BVA LARVACIDE OIL 2, ACTIVE INGREDIENT NO BID NO BID NO BID
(HIGHLY REVINED PETROLEUM DISTILLATE)
97%, INERT INGREDIENTS 3%, 55 GAL
DRUM, OR EQUAL




THIS DOCUMENT IS SUBJECT TO FINAL REVIEW I

CITY OF FARMINGTON - ABSTRACT SCHEDULE

BID: Herbicides, Insecticides, Fungicides, and Miscellaneous C

EST
ANNUAL

ITEM QTY

UOM

DESCRIPTION

HELENA CHEMICAL CO.
DAN BLAESER

8905 ADAMS NE
ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87113
(505) 797-5800

5% IN-STATE

UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE

RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC.

LARRY MAULDIN
PO BOX 226
HARPER, TX 78631
(830) 864-5363

UNIT TOTAL

5% IN-STATE
PREFERENCE

CLARKE MOSQUITO PRODUCTS, INC.
DOUG CARROLL

110 E IRVING PARK RD. 4TH FLOOR
ROSELLE, IL 60172

(800) 323-5727

5% IN-STATE

UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE

Al.

2

CASE

DEMAND EZ, SYNGENTA, 1/2 GAL 8 JUG PER
CASE, ACTIVE INGREDIENT
LAMBDA-CYHALOTHRIN 2.43%, OTHER
INGREDIENTS 97.57%, OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

AJ.

BAG

BAYER MERIT 75 WSP, 4 X 1.6 OZ PACKETS
PER BAG, ACTIVE INGREDIENT
IMIDACLOPRID, 1-[(6-CHLORO-3-
PYRIDINYL)METHYL]-N-NITRO-2-
IMIDAZOLIDINIMINE 75%, INERT
INGREDIENTS 25%, OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

FUNGICIDES

AK.

Cs

LIQUID,SCOTTS PRO-TURF, ACTIVE
INGREDIENT: IPRODIONE 19%,
THIOPHENATE METHYL 19.65%. ONE-HALF
(1/2) GALLON COVERS APPROXIMATELY
60,000 SQ. FT., 4.5 GAL/CASE, OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

AL.

Cs

FLUID FUNGICIDE II, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS:
16% TRIADIMEFON, 16% METALAXYL,
COVERS 2.07 ACRES - SCOTTS LIQUID OR
EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

AM.

30

GAL

DACONIL 2787 FLOWABLE FUNGICIDE.
ACTIVE INGREDIENT: CHLOROTHALONIL
(TETRACHLOROISOPHTHALONITRILE)
40.4%, INERT INGREDIENTS 59.6%,
SYNGENTA OR EQUAL

$ 126.00 | $3,780.00 | $

3,591.00

$ 30.50 | $ 915.00

$ 915.00

NO BID

AN.

Cs

CHIPCO 26019 FLO, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS:
IPRODIONE: 3-(3,5-DICHLOROPHENYL)-N-(1-
METHYLETHYL)-2, 4-DIOXO-1-
IMIDAZOLIDINECARBOXAMIDE 23.3%, INERT
INGREDIENTS 76.7%, 2 2.5 GAL
CONTAINERS/CASE, RHONE-POULENC AG
COMPANY OR EQUAL

*
&+

59.40 [ $1,188.00 | $

1,128.60

*1$ 65.00 | $ 1,300.00

$ 1,300.00

NO BID

AO.

80

GAL

DACONIL ULTREX, TURF AND ORNAMENTAL
FUNGICIDE, ACTIVE INGREDIENT:
CHLOROTHALONIL
(TETRACHLOROISOPHTHALONITRILE)
82.5%, INERT INGREDIENTS 17.5%, 4 5GAL
CONTAINER/CASE, SYNGENTA OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID




THIS DOCUMENT IS SUBJECT TO FINAL REVIEW I

CITY OF FARMINGTON - ABSTRACT SCHEDULE

BID: Herbicides, Insecticides, Fungicides, and Miscellaneous C

EST
ANNUAL

ITEM QTY

UOM

DESCRIPTION

HELENA CHEMICAL CO.

DAN BLAESER

8905 ADAMS NE
ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87113

(505) 797-5800

UNIT

TOTAL

5% IN-STATE
PREFERENCE

RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC.
LARRY MAULDIN

PO BOX 226

HARPER, TX 78631

(830) 864-5363

5% IN-STATE

UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE

CLARKE MOSQUITO PRODUCTS, INC.
DOUG CARROLL

110 E IRVING PARK RD. 4TH FLOOR
ROSELLE, IL 60172

(800) 323-5727

5% IN-STATE

UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE

AP.

4

Cs

HERITAGE, FUNGICIDE, ACTIVE
INGREDIENT: AZOXYSTROBIN: METHYL (E)-
2-{2-[6-(2-CYANOPHENOXY) PYRIMIDIN-4-
YLOXY] PHENYL} -3-METHOXYACRYLATE
50%, INERT INGREDIENTS 50%, 6 1LB
CONTAINERS/CASE, SYNGENTA OR EQUAL

309.00

$7,416.00

$ 7,045.20

NO BID

NO BID

AQ.

10

GAL

SYNGENTA INSTRATA, CHLOROTHALONIL
(TETRACHLOROISOPHTHALONITRILE) CAS
NO 1897-45-6 29.9%, PROPICONAZOLE (CAS
NO. 60207-90-1) 4.7%, FLUDIOXONIL (CAS
NO. 131341-86-1) 1.2%, OTHER
INGREDIENTS 64.2%, 2.5 GAL CONT, OR
EOLIAl

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

AR.

10

GAL

DACONIL WEATHER STIK,
CHLOROTHALONIL
(TETRACHLOROISOPHTHALONITRILE) 72%,
OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 30.50 [ $ 305.00 | $ 305.00

NO BID

AS.

10

LBS

PHOENIX PEREGRINE, ACTIVE INGREDIENT
CHLOROTHALONIL
TETRACHLOROISOPHTHALONITRILE 50%,
THIOPHANATE-METHYL DIMETHYL 4,4'-O-
PHENYLENEBIS (3-THIOALLOPHANATE)
16.66%, OTHER INGREDIENTS 33.34%, OR
EQUAL

NO BID

$ 30.50 | $ 305.00 | $ 305.00

NO BID

AT.

10

GAL

BAYLETON SYSTEMIC FUNGICIDE IN WATER
SOLUBLE PACKETS, 4 X 5.5 OZ PACKETS
PER BAG, ACTIVE INGREDIENT 1-(4-
CHLOROPHENOXY)-3,3-DIMETHYL-1-(1H-
1,2,4-TRIAZOL-1-YL)-2-BUTANONE 25%,
INERT INGREDIENTS 75 %, OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

AU.

GAL

CROMPTON TURFSIDE, ACTIVE
INGREDIENT
PENTACHLORONITROBENZENE 10%, INERT
INGREDIENTS 90%, OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

MISCELLANEOUS

AV.

175

GAL

PRIME OIL, 83% PARAFYNE BASE
PETROLEUM ALSO KNOWN AS
SURFACTANT 2.5 GAL CONTAINER, (NO 5
GAL. CONTAINERS), OR EQUAL

15.00

$2,625.00

$ 2,493.75

$ 11.00 | $1,925.00 | $ 1,925.00

NO BID

AW.

50

PKG

SPRAY COLORANT WATER SOLUBLE
PACKS FOR USE IN CHEMICAL MIXES .
(1PKG TO MIX APPROXIMATELY 50-150
GALLON TANKS) PBI GORDON OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID




THIS DOCUMENT IS SUBJECT TO FINAL REVIEW I

CITY OF FARMINGTON - ABSTRACT SCHEDULE

BID: Herbicides, Insecticides, Fungicides, and Miscellaneous C

EST
ANNUAL
ITEM QTY

UOM

DESCRIPTION

HELENA CHEMICAL CO.
DAN BLAESER

8905 ADAMS NE
ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87113
(505) 797-5800

UNIT TOTAL

5% IN-STATE
PREFERENCE

RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC.

LARRY MAULDIN
PO BOX 226
HARPER, TX 78631
(830) 864-5363

UNIT TOTAL

5% IN-STATE
PREFERENCE

CLARKE MOSQUITO PRODUCTS, INC.
DOUG CARROLL

110 E IRVING PARK RD. 4TH FLOOR
ROSELLE, IL 60172

(800) 323-5727

5% IN-STATE

UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE

AX. 2

GAL

SYNGENTA TRIMMIT 2SC, ACTIVE
INGREDIENT PACLOBUTRAZOL 22.3%,
OTHER INGREDIENTS 77.7%, 1 GAL CONT,
OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 295.00 | $ 590.00

$ 590.00

NO BID

AY. 2

GAL

SYNGENTA PRIMO MAXX, ACTIVE
INGREDIENT TRINEXAPAC-ETHYL (CAS NO.
95266-40-3) 11.3%, OTHER INGREDIENTS

NO BID

$ 200.00 | $ 400.00

$ 400.00

NO BID

AZ. 2

GAL

ANDERSONS GOLF PRODUCTS TURF
ENHANCER 2SC, OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

BA. 20

GAL

BAYER PROXY GROTH REGULATOR,
ACTIVE INGREDIENT ETHEPHON [(2-
CHLOROETHYL) PHOSPHONIC ACID] 21.7%,
OTHER INGREDIENT 78.3%, OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 31.00 | $ 620.00

$ 620.00

NO BID

BB. 55

GAL

SOIL WETTING AGENT FOR TURF, WETTING
AGENT. ACTIVE INGREDIENT: FERMENT
25%, CARRIER 70.5%, LINEAR PRIMARY
ALCOHOL ETHAYLATE, FATTY ACID
ETHATLATE 4.5%, SODIUM FARRAYL
SULFATE, OR EQUAL

$ 32.00 | $1,760.00

$ 1,672.00

$ 40.00 | $ 2,200.00

$ 2,200.00

NO BID

BC. 30

GAL

HI-LIGHT LIQUID, PRODUCT CODE: HL.LIQ,
2.5 GAL (NO 5 GAL OR QUART CONTAINERS)
BECKER-UNDERWOOD INC. OR EQUAL

$ 45.00 | $1,350.00

$ 1,282.50

$ 39.00 | $1,170.00

$ 1,170.00

NO BID

BD. 100

GAL

SUNPAR 107 (MINERAL OIL), OR EQUAL

$ 750 $ 750.00

$ 712.50

NO BID

NO BID

BE. 55

GAL

FERROMEC AC LIQUID IRON 15-00,
GUARANTEED ANALYSIS = 15% UREA
NITROGEN, SULFUR 3%, IRON 6% 2.5 GAL,
30 GAL, OR 55 GAL CONTAINER, PBI
GORDON OR EQUAL

$ 8.00 | $ 440.00

$ 418.00

NO BID

NO BID

BF. 5

CASE

SCOTTS PRO TURF, TURF ENHANCER 2SC,
2 640Z CONTAINERS/CASE, OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

BG. 40

BAG

SCOTTS, HIGH K FERTILIZER PLUS, TURF
ENHANCER 15-0-29, OR EQUAL

$ 63.00 | $2,520.00

$ 2,394.00

NO BID

NO BID

SIGNED:

YES

YES

YES

IN-STATE PREFERENCE:

YES 43R25

NO

NO

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET 30

NET 30

NET 30

DELIVERY:

7-10 CAL DAYS

7 CAL DAYS

2-3 DAYS

ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED:

NO

1 OF 3 ACK

1 OF 3 ACK

*  exceptions to unit of measure

exceptions to unit of measure

*  exceptions to unit of measure
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CITY OF FARMINGTON - ABSTRACT SCHEDULE

BID: Herbicides, Insecticides, Fungicides, and Miscellaneous C

EST
ANNUAL

ITEM QTY

UOM

DESCRIPTION

GOLF ENVIRO SYSTEMS, INC.
MARVIN ANDREWS

3240 FILLMORE RIDGE HIGHTS
COLORADO SPRINGS, CO 80907

(719) 590-8884

UNIT

TOTAL

5% IN-STATE
PREFERENCE

AGRIAM ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES
DARYL DINKEL

419 18TH ST

GREELEY, CO 80631

(970) 672-6240

5% IN-STATE

UNIT TOTAL

PREFERENCE

CROP PRODUCTION SERVICES, INC.
BARRY WALLACE

PO BOX 200

MESQUITE, NM 88048

(602) 558-4350

5% IN-STATE

UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE

HERBICIDES

A.

210

GAL

LIQUID, ROUND UP PRO, ACTIVE
INGREDIENT: GLYPHOSATE IN FORM OF
ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE
41%. INERT INGREDIENTS (INCLUDING
SURFACTANT), 2.5 GAL. OR 30 GAL
CONTAINER MONSANTO CO. OR EQUAL

$ 17.42

$ 3,658.20

$

3,658.20

$ 10.65 | $2,236.50 | $

2,124.68

$ 14.10 [ $2,961.00 | $ 2,812.95

30

GAL

LIQUID, TRIMEC, ACTIVE INGREDIENT:
DIMETHYLAMINE SALT OF 2,4
DICHLOROPHENOXYACETIC 25.93%,
DIMETHYLAMINE SALT OF 2-(2-METHYL-4-
CHLOROPHENOXY), PROPIONIC ACID
13.85%, DIMETHYLAMINE SALT OF
DICAMBA, (3,6 DICHLORO-O-ANISIC ACID)
2.76%, 2.5 GAL CASE OR 30 GAL
CONTAINER, PBI GORDON CORP. OR

$ 32.11

$ 963.30

963.30

$ 1840 ($ 552.00 $

524.40

NO BID

230

GAL

AMINE 400 2-4D, DIMETHYLAMINE SALE OF
2,4-DICHLOROPHENOXYACETIC ACID -
46.4% INERT INGREDIENTS 53.6%, 2.5 GAL.
CONTAINER, PBI GORDON OR EQUAL

$ 14.72

$ 3,385.60

3,385.60

$ 1450 | $3,335.00 | $

3,168.25

$ 14.80 | $3,404.00 | $ 3,233.80

20

GAL

CURTAIL, CLOPYRALID: (3.6-DICHLORO-2-
PYRIDINECARBOXYLIC ACID) 7.5%; AND 2.4-
DICHLOROPHENOXYACETIC ACID 38.4% -
AS ALKANOIA MINE SALTS, OF THE
ETHANOL AND ISOPROPANOL SERIES,
INERT INGREDIENTS 54.1%, 2-2.5 GAL/CS,
DOW AGRO OR EQUAL

$ 49.61

$ 992.20

992.20

NO BID

NO BID

10

GAL

GARLON 4 (4 LBS ESTER TRICLOPYR PER
GALLON), 2-2.5 GAL/CS, DOW AGRO- OR
EQUAL

$ 110.27

$1,102.70

1,102.70

$ 101.00 | $1,010.00 | $

959.50

$ 76.00 ($ 760.00 | $ 722.00

420

LBS

KROVARI1-D.F., ACTIVE INGREDIENTS: 80%,
40% BROMACIL, 40% DIURON, INERT
INGREDIENTS: 20% , 6 POUND BAGS,
DUPONT OR EQUAL

$ 14.38

$6,039.60

6,039.60

$ 14.06 | $5,905.20 | $

5,609.94

$ 12.30 | $5,166.00 | $ 4,907.70

80

oz

TELAR, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS:
CHLORSULFURON, 2-CHLORO-N-[(4-
METHOXY-6-METHYL-1,3,5-TRIAZIN-2-YL)-
AMINOCARBONYL],
BENZENESULFONAMIDE, 1 LB CONTAINER,
DUPONT OR EQUAL

$ 21.00

$1,680.00

1,680.00

NO BID

$ 16.30 | $1,304.00 | $ 1,238.80




THIS DOCUMENT IS SUBJECT TO FINAL REVIEW I

CITY OF FARMINGTON - ABSTRACT SCHEDULE

BID: Herbicides, Insecticides, Fungicides, and Miscellaneous C

ITEM QTY

EST
ANNUAL
UOM

DESCRIPTION

GOLF ENVIRO SYSTEMS, INC.

MARVIN ANDREWS

3240 FILLMORE RIDGE HIGHTS
COLORADO SPRINGS, CO 80907

(719) 590-8884

UNIT

TOTAL

5% IN-STATE
PREFERENCE

AGRIAM ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES

DARYL DINKEL
419 18TH ST

GREELEY, CO 80631

(970) 672-6240

UNIT

TOTAL

5% IN-STATE
PREFERENCE

CROP PRODUCTION SERVICES, INC.

BARRY WALLACE
PO BOX 200

MESQUITE, NM 88048

(602) 558-4350

UNIT

TOTAL

5% IN-STATE
PREFERENCE

H.

20({GAL

TORDON K, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS:
PICLORAM: 4-AMINO-3,5,6-
TRICHLOROPICOLINIC ACID, AS THE
POTASSIUM SALT, 2-2.5 GAL/CS, DOW
AGRO OR EQUAL

$ 76.88

$1,537.60

$ 1,537.60

87.76

$1,755.20

$ 1,755.20

$ 86.00

$1,720.00

$ 1,634.00

144|LBS

KARMEX DF, ACTIVE INGREDIENT: DIURON
[3-(3,4-DICHLOROPHENYL) -1,1-
DIMETHYLUREA], 4 LB CONTAINER, DUPONT
OR APPROVED EQUAL

*
%

8.00

$1,160.00

$ 1,160.00

6.68

$ 961.92

$ 961.92

$ 5.80

$ 835.20

$ 793.44

120|0z

ESCORT, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS:
METSULFURON METHYL {METHYL 2-[([[(4-
METHOXY-6-METHYL-1,3 5-TRIAZIN-2-YL)
AMINO]-CARBONYL]-AMINO]
SULFONYL]BENZOATE}, 8 OZ CONTAINER,
DUPONT OR EQUAL

11.77

$1,506.56

$ 1,506.56

14.80

$1,776.00

$ 1,776.00

$ 10.40

$1,248.00

$ 1,185.60

180|GAL

PRAMITOL 25E, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS:
PROMETON-2-4-BIS, (ISOPRUPYLAMINO 6-
METHORY-5-TRIAZINE) 25%, 2-2.5 GAL/CS,
MAKHTESHIM AGAN OR APPROVED EQUAL

33.61

$6,049.80

$ 6,049.80

33.01

$5,941.80

$ 5,941.80

$ 33.00

$5,940.00

$ 5,643.00

186|LBS

SPIKE, 80W, ACTIVE INGREDITENTS:
TEBUTHIURON N-5-11, DIMETHYLETHY
THEODIAZOL, DIMETHYLUREA, 5 GAL
CONTAINER, DOW AGRO OR EQUAL

15.05

$2,784.25

$ 2,784.25

NO BID

21.05

$3,915.30

$ 3,719.54

600|LBS

SAHARA DG , ACTIVE INGREDIENT:
IMAZAPYR (2-[4,5-DIHODRO-4-METHYL-4-(1-
METHYLETHYL)-5-OXO-1H-IMIDAZOL-2-YL]-3-
PYRIDINECARBOXYLIC ACID) 7.78%,
DIURON (3-[3,4-DICHLOROPHENYL]-1,1-
DIMETHYLUREA), 10 LB CONTAINER, BASF
OR EQUAL

$ 11.61

$ 6,966.00

$ 6,966.00

10.75

$ 6,450.00

$ 6,450.00

$ 12.80

$ 7,680.00

$ 7,296.00

110|GAL

MOMENTUM, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS:
TRISOPROPANOLAMINE SALT OF 2,4-
DICHLOROPHENOXYACETIC ACID - 50.7%;
TRIETHYLAMINE SALT OF 3,5,6-TRICHLORO-
2-PYRIDINYLOXYACETIC ACID - 3.8%; 3,6-
DICHLORO-2-PYRIDINECARBOXYLIC ACID -
1.3%; INERT INGREDIENTS 44.2%, 2.5 GAL.
CONTAINER, LESCO INC. OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

50(LBS

PRODIAMINE 65 WDG - PRODIAMINE (CAS
NO. 29091-21-2) 65%, INERT INGREDIENTS
35%, 5 LB CONTAINER VEGETATION
MANAGER OR EQUAL

$ 26.50

$1,325.00

$ 1,325.00

13.50

$ 675.00

$ 675.00

$ 16.00

$ 800.00

$ 760.00




THIS DOCUMENT IS SUBJECT TO FINAL REVIEW I

CITY OF FARMINGTON - ABSTRACT SCHEDULE

BID: Herbicides, Insecticides, Fungicides, and Miscellaneous C

EST
ANNUAL
ITEM QTY

UOM

DESCRIPTION

GOLF ENVIRO SYSTEMS, INC.
MARVIN ANDREWS

3240 FILLMORE RIDGE HIGHTS
COLORADO SPRINGS, CO 80907
(719) 590-8884

5% IN-STATE

UNIT TOTAL

PREFERENCE

AGRIAM ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES
DARYL DINKEL

419 18TH ST

GREELEY, CO 80631

(970) 672-6240

5% IN-STATE

UNIT TOTAL

PREFERENCE

CROP PRODUCTION SERVICES, INC.
BARRY WALLACE

PO BOX 200

MESQUITE, NM 88048

(602) 558-4350

5% IN-STATE

UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE

P. 69

LBS

OUST 75% SULFOMETURON METHLY, 3 LB
CONTAINER, DUPONT OR EQUAL

$ 94.35 | $6,510.15 | $

6,510.15

$ 96.00 | $6,624.00 | $

6,624.00

$ 68.00 | $4,692.00 | $ 4,457.40

Q. 20

GAL

AQUA MASTER, ACTIVE INGREDIENT 53.8%
GLYPHOSATE

NON-IONIC SURFACTANT R-11 ACTIVE
INGREDIENT NONYLPHENOL
POLYETHOXYLATE (AQUATIC
SURFACTANT), 2 - 2.5 GAL/CS, MONSANTO
OR EQUAL

$ 3811 ($ 76220 | %

762.20

$ 25.00 | $ 500.00|$%$

500.00

$ 16.10 | $ 322.00 | $ 305.90

R. 25

GAL

VISTA XRT, ACTIVE INGREDIEMTS FLUROX
1-METHYLHEPHLYL ESTER (4-AMINO-
3,50DICHLORO 6-FLUORO-2-PYRIDINYLOXY)
ACETIC 54.52%, 2 - 2.5 GAL/CS, DOW AGRA
OR EQUAL

$ 209.90 | $5,24750 | $

5,247.50

NO BID

$ 171.00 | $4,275.00 | $ 4,061.25

GAL

NON-IONIC SURFACTANT R-11, ACTIVE
INGREDIENT NONYLPHENOL
POLYETHOXYLATE (AQUATIC SURFACTANT)
2 - 2.5 GAL/CS, OR EQUAL

$ 2045 ($ 20450 | $

204.50

$ 1195 ($ 11950 | $

119.50

$ 16.00 [ $ 160.00 | $ 152.00

GAL

ORYZALIN 4 PRO - 3,5-DINITRO-N4N4-
DIPROPYLSULFANILAMIDE 41%, INERT
INGREDIENTS 59%, CONTAINS 4 POUNDS
OF ACTIVE INGREDIENT PER GALLON, 2.5
GAL CONTAINER, OR EQUAL

NO BID

$ 48.70 | $ 974.00 | $

974.00

$ 46.50 | $ 930.00 | $ 883.50

CASE

MILESTONE SPECIALTY HERBICIDE, 5
GAL/CASE, ACTIVE INGREDIENT
AMINOPYRALID 40.6%, OR EQUAL

5540 ($ 277.00|$

277.00

NO BID

$ 1,490.00 | $1,490.00 | $ 1,415.50

GAL

DOW AGRO CONFRONT, ACTIVE
INGREDIENTS: TRICLOPYR: 3,5,6-
TRICHLORO-2-PYRIDINYLOXYACETIC ACID,
TRIETHYLAMINE SALT 33%, CLOPYRALID 3,6
DICHLORO-2-PYRIDINECARBOXYLIC ACID,
TRIETHYLAMINE SALT 12.1%, OTHER
INGREDIENTS 54.9%, OR EQUAL

$ 138.70 | $1,387.00 | $

1,387.00

$ 125.00 | $1,250.00 | $

1,250.00

$ 127.75 [ $1,277.50 | $ 1,213.63

GAL

BPI GORDON BENSUMEC 4 LF, ACTIVE
INGREDIENT BENSULIDE: S-(O,0-
DIISOPROPYL PHOSPHORODITHIOATE)
ESTER OF N-(2-MRCAPTOETHYL)
BENZENESULFONAMIDE 46%, INERT
INGREDIENTS 54%, OR EQUAL

$ 99.20 [ $1,984.00 | $

1,984.00

$ 97.00 | $1,940.00 | $

1,940.00

NO BID




THIS DOCUMENT IS SUBJECT TO FINAL REVIEW I

CITY OF FARMINGTON - ABSTRACT SCHEDULE

BID: Herbicides, Insecticides, Fungicides, and Miscellaneous C

EST
ANNUAL

ITEM QTY

UOM

DESCRIPTION

GOLF ENVIRO SYSTEMS, INC.
MARVIN ANDREWS

3240 FILLMORE RIDGE HIGHTS
COLORADO SPRINGS, CO 80907
(719) 590-8884

5% IN-STATE

UNIT TOTAL

PREFERENCE

AGRIAM ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES
DARYL DINKEL

419 18TH ST

GREELEY, CO 80631

(970) 672-6240

5% IN-STATE

UNIT TOTAL

PREFERENCE

CROP PRODUCTION SERVICES, INC.
BARRY WALLACE

PO BOX 200

MESQUITE, NM 88048

(602) 558-4350

5% IN-STATE

UNIT TOTAL

PREFERENCE

X.

20

GAL

PBI GORDON SPEED ZONE, ACTIVE
INGREDIENTS: CARFENTRAZONE-ETHYL
.62%, 2,4-D,2-ETHYLHEXYL ESTER 28.57%,
MECOPROP-P ACID 5.88%, DICAMBA ACID
1.71%, INERT INGREDIENTS 63.22%, OR
EQUAL

$ 61.00 | $1,220.00 | $

1,220.00

$ 59.50 | $1,190.00 | $

1,190.00

NO BID

GAL

DOW AGRO RODEO, ACTIVE INGREDIENT
GLYPHOSATE N-
(PHOSPHONOMETHYL)GLYCINE,
ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT 53.8%, OTHER
INGREDIENTS 46.2%, 2.5 GAL CONTAINTER,
OR EQUAL

$ 38.10 ($ 190.50 | $

190.50

NO BID

$ 16.00|$ 80.00 (%

76.00

INSECTICIDES

10

GAL

SCOURGE, RESMETHRIN 18%, PIPERONYL
BUTOXIDE TECHNICAL 54%,

OTHER INGREDEDIENTS 28%, 5 GAL
CONTAINER, BAYER OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

110

GAL

BVA 13, 55 GAL. CONTAINER, OR EQUAL

$ 6.50|$ 715.00 |$

715.00

NO BID

NO BID

AB.

25

GAL

VECTOBAC 12AS, 2.5 GAL CONTAINER,
VALENT OR EQUAL

$ 26.10 [$ 65250 | $

652.50

NO BID

NO BID

AC.

220

CY-KICK (Crack & Crevice) RESIDUAL, 11 LB
CYL CONTAINER, WHITMIRE OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

AD.

CASE

TEMPO WP, BETA-CYFLUTHRIN TECHNICAL
11%, CRYSTALLINE SILICA (QUARTZ) 7.48%
BAYER OR EQUAL

4045 | % 970.80 | $

970.80

NO BID

NO BID

AE.

40

GAL

KONTROL 30-30, PERMETHRIN 309%,
PIPERONYL BUTOXIDE TECHNICAL 30%,
INTERT INGREDIENTS 40%, 2 - 2.5 GAL
CONTAINER, OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

AF.

CASE

BTI BRIQUETS, ACTIVE INGREDIENT 10.31%,
INERT INGREDIENTS 89.69%, 100
BRIQUETS/CS, OR EQUAL

$ 7630 |$ 76.30|$%

76.30

NO BID

NO BID

AG.

CASE

AGNIQUE MMF, 2 - 2.5 GAL/CS, COGNIS
CORP OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

AH.

DRUM

BVA LARVACIDE OIL 2, ACTIVE INGREDIENT
(HIGHLY REVINED PETROLEUM DISTILLATE)
97%, INERT INGREDIENTS 3%, 55 GAL
DRUM, OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID




THIS DOCUMENT IS SUBJECT TO FINAL REVIEW I

CITY OF FARMINGTON - ABSTRACT SCHEDULE
BID: Herbicides, Insecticides, Fungicides, and Miscellaneous C

GOLF ENVIRO SYSTEMS, INC. AGRIAM ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES CROP PRODUCTION SERVICES, INC.
MARVIN ANDREWS DARYL DINKEL BARRY WALLACE
3240 FILLMORE RIDGE HIGHTS 419 18TH ST PO BOX 200
COLORADO SPRINGS, CO 80907 GREELEY, CO 80631 MESQUITE, NM 88048
(719) 590-8884 (970) 672-6240 (602) 558-4350
EST
ANNUAL 5% IN-STATE 5% IN-STATE 5% IN-STATE
ITEM QTY UOM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE
Al. 2|CASE |[DEMAND EZ, SYNGENTA, 1/2 GAL 8 JUG PER|* $ 23301 % 372801 % 372.80 NO BID NO BID

CASE, ACTIVE INGREDIENT
LAMBDA-CYHALOTHRIN 2.43%, OTHER
INGREDIENTS 97.57%, OR EQUAL

AJ. 5[BAG |BAYER MERIT 75 WSP, 4 X 1.6 OZ PACKETS |* | $ 1540 [$ 49280 | $ 49280 | | $ 307.00 [ $ 307.00 ] $ 307.00 NO BID
PER BAG, ACTIVE INGREDIENT
IMIDACLOPRID, 1-[(6-CHLORO-3-
PYRIDINYL)METHYL]-N-NITRO-2-
IMIDAZOLIDINIMINE 75%, INERT
INGREDIENTS 25%, OR EQUAL

FUNGICIDES

AK. 4|CS  [LIQUID,SCOTTS PRO-TURF, ACTIVE $ 322.20 | $5,155.20 | $ 5,155.20 $ 98.50 [ $ 394.00 | $ 394.00 NO BID
INGREDIENT: IPRODIONE 19%,

THIOPHENATE METHYL 19.65%. ONE-HALF
(1/2) GALLON COVERS APPROXIMATELY
60,000 SQ. FT., 4.5 GAL/CASE, OR EQUAL

AL. 4|CS  |FLUID FUNGICIDE II, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS: NO BID NO BID NO BID
16% TRIADIMEFON, 16% METALAXYL,
COVERS 2.07 ACRES - SCOTTS LIQUID OR
EQUAL

AM. 30[GAL |DACONIL 2787 FLOWABLE FUNGICIDE. NO BID $ 2010]$ 873.00] % 873.00 NO BID
ACTIVE INGREDIENT: CHLOROTHALONIL

(TETRACHLOROISOPHTHALONITRILE)
40.4%, INERT INGREDIENTS 59.6%,
SYNGENTA OR EQUAL

*

AN. 4|Cs CHIPCO 26019 FLO, ACTIVE INGREDIENTS:
IPRODIONE: 3-(3,5-DICHLOROPHENYL)-N-(1-
METHYLETHYL)-2, 4-DIOXO-1-
IMIDAZOLIDINECARBOXAMIDE 23.3%, INERT
INGREDIENTS 76.7%, 2 2.5 GAL
CONTAINERS/CASE, RHONE-POULENC AG
COMPANY OR EQUAL

$ 134.20 | $2,684.00 | $ 2,684.00 |* | $ 46.00 [ $ 920.00 | $ 920.00 NO BID

AO. 80[GAL |[DACONIL ULTREX, TURF AND ORNAMENTAL| | $ 4055 | $3,244.00 | $ 3.24400 [* |$ 575|$ 460.00 % 460.00 NO BID
FUNGICIDE, ACTIVE INGREDIENT:
CHLOROTHALONIL
(TETRACHLOROISOPHTHALONITRILE)
82.5%, INERT INGREDIENTS 17.5%, 4 5GAL
CONTAINER/CASE, SYNGENTA OR EQUAL
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CITY OF FARMINGTON - ABSTRACT SCHEDULE

BID: Herbicides, Insecticides, Fungicides, and Miscellaneous C

EST
ANNUAL
ITEM QTY

UOM

DESCRIPTION

GOLF ENVIRO SYSTEMS, INC.

MARVIN ANDREWS

3240 FILLMORE RIDGE HIGHTS
COLORADO SPRINGS, CO 80907

(719) 590-8884

UNIT

TOTAL

5% IN-STATE
PREFERENCE

AGRIAM ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES

DARYL DINKEL
419 18TH ST
GREELEY, CO 80631
(970) 672-6240

UNIT

TOTAL

5% IN-STATE
PREFERENCE

CROP PRODUCTION SERVICES, INC.

BARRY WALLACE
PO BOX 200

MESQUITE, NM 88048

(602) 558-4350

UNIT

TOTAL

5% IN-STATE
PREFERENCE

AP. 4

Cs

HERITAGE, FUNGICIDE, ACTIVE
INGREDIENT: AZOXYSTROBIN: METHYL (E)-
2-{2-[6-(2-CYANOPHENOXY) PYRIMIDIN-4-
YLOXY] PHENYL} -3-METHOXYACRYLATE
50%, INERT INGREDIENTS 50%, 6 1LB
CONTAINERS/CASE, SYNGENTA OR EQUAL

$ 309.00

$7,416.00

$ 7,416.00

31.31

$7,512.00

$ 7,512.00

NO BID

AQ. 10

GAL

SYNGENTA INSTRATA, CHLOROTHALONIL
(TETRACHLOROISOPHTHALONITRILE) CAS
NO 1897-45-6 29.9%, PROPICONAZOLE (CAS
NO. 60207-90-1) 4.7%, FLUDIOXONIL (CAS
NO. 131341-86-1) 1.2%, OTHER
INGREDIENTS 64.2%, 2.5 GAL CONT, OR
EOLIAl

156.00

$1,560.00

1,560.00

156.00

$1,560.00

1,560.00

NO BID

AR. 10

GAL

DACONIL WEATHER STIK,
CHLOROTHALONIL
(TETRACHLOROISOPHTHALONITRILE) 72%,
OR EQUAL

56.50

565.00

565.00

29.10

$ 291.00

291.00

NO BID

AS. 10

LBS

PHOENIX PEREGRINE, ACTIVE INGREDIENT
CHLOROTHALONIL
TETRACHLOROISOPHTHALONITRILE 50%,
THIOPHANATE-METHYL DIMETHYL 4,4'-O-
PHENYLENEBIS (3-THIOALLOPHANATE)
16.66%, OTHER INGREDIENTS 33.34%, OR
EQUAL

15.40

154.00

154.00

7.90

$ 79.00

79.00

NO BID

AT. 10

GAL

BAYLETON SYSTEMIC FUNGICIDE IN WATER
SOLUBLE PACKETS, 4 X 5.5 OZ PACKETS
PER BAG, ACTIVE INGREDIENT 1-(4-
CHLOROPHENOXY)-3,3-DIMETHYL-1-(1H-
1,2,4-TRIAZOL-1-YL)-2-BUTANONE 25%,
INERT INGREDIENTS 75 %, OR EQUAL

546.60

546.60

546.60

120.00

$ 240.00

240.00

NO BID

AU. 5

GAL

CROMPTON TURFSIDE, ACTIVE
INGREDIENT
PENTACHLORONITROBENZENE 10%, INERT
INGREDIENTS 90%, OR EQUAL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

MISCELLANEOUS

AV. 175

GAL

PRIME OIL, 83% PARAFYNE BASE
PETROLEUM ALSO KNOWN AS
SURFACTANT 2.5 GAL CONTAINER, (NO 5
GAL. CONTAINERS), OR EQUAL

$ 23.60

$4,130.00

4,130.00

11.95

$2,091.25

2,091.25

NO BID

AW. 50

PKG

SPRAY COLORANT WATER SOLUBLE
PACKS FOR USE IN CHEMICAL MIXES .
(1PKG TO MIX APPROXIMATELY 50-150
GALLON TANKS) PBI GORDON OR EQUAL

* s 170.00

$ 170.00

170.00

38.75

$ 465.00

465.00

NO BID
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BID: Herbicides, Insecticides, Fungicides, and Miscellaneous C

GOLF ENVIRO SYSTEMS, INC. AGRIAM ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES CROP PRODUCTION SERVICES, INC.
MARVIN ANDREWS DARYL DINKEL BARRY WALLACE
3240 FILLMORE RIDGE HIGHTS 419 18TH ST PO BOX 200
COLORADO SPRINGS, CO 80907 GREELEY, CO 80631 MESQUITE, NM 88048
(719) 590-8884 (970) 672-6240 (602) 558-4350
EST
ANNUAL 5% IN-STATE 5% IN-STATE 5% IN-STATE
ITEM QTY UOM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE UNIT TOTAL PREFERENCE
AX. 2[GAL [SYNGENTA TRIMMIT 2SC, ACTIVE $ 44220 [$ 884.40 [$ 884.40 $ 300.00 [$ 600.00 [ $ 600.00 NO BID
INGREDIENT PACLOBUTRAZOL 22.3%,
OTHER INGREDIENTS 77.7%, 1 GAL CONT,
OR EQUAL
AY. 2[GAL [SYNGENTA PRIMO MAXX, ACTIVE $ 275.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 550.00 $ 170.00 | $ 340.00 | $ 340.00 NO BID

INGREDIENT TRINEXAPAC-ETHYL (CAS NO.
95266-40-3) 11.3%, OTHER INGREDIENTS

AZ. 2|GAL  |ANDERSONS GOLF PRODUCTS TURF * | $ 14220 ($ 568.80 | $ 568.80 $ 300.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 600.00 NO BID
ENHANCER 2SC, OR EQUAL

BA. 20|GAL  |BAYER PROXY GROTH REGULATOR, $ 35.10 | $ 702.00 | $ 702.00 $ 2760 | $ 552.00|% 552.00 NO BID
ACTIVE INGREDIENT ETHEPHON [(2-

CHLOROETHYL) PHOSPHONIC ACID] 21.7%,
OTHER INGREDIENT 78.3%, OR EQUAL

BB. S5(GAL  [SOIL WETTING AGENT FOR TURF, WETTING $ 19.20 | $1,056.00 | $ 1,056.00 $ 50.00 | $2,750.00 | $ 2,750.00 NO BID
AGENT. ACTIVE INGREDIENT: FERMENT

25%, CARRIER 70.5%, LINEAR PRIMARY
ALCOHOL ETHAYLATE, FATTY ACID
ETHATLATE 4.5%, SODIUM FARRAYL
SULFATE, OR EQUAL

BC. 30|GAL  [HI-LIGHT LIQUID, PRODUCT CODE: HL.LIQ, $ 40.25 | $1,207.50 | $ 1,207.50 $ 30.00 ($ 900.00 | $ 900.00 NO BID
2.5 GAL (NO 5 GAL OR QUART CONTAINERS)

BECKER-UNDERWOOD INC. OR EQUAL

BD. 100{GAL |SUNPAR 107 (MINERAL OIL), OR EQUAL $ 19.55 | $1,955.00 | $ 1,955.00 NO BID NO BID

BE. 55|GAL  |FERROMEC AC LIQUID IRON 15-00, $ 870 |$ 47850 (% 478.50 $ 650 |$ 35750 (% 357.50 NO BID
GUARANTEED ANALYSIS = 15% UREA

NITROGEN, SULFUR 3%, IRON 6% 2.5 GAL,
30 GAL, OR 55 GAL CONTAINER, PBI
GORDON OR EQUAL

BF. 5|CASE [SCOTTS PRO TURF, TURF ENHANCER 25C, [* | $ 142.20 | $1,422.00 | $ 1,422.00 [* | $ 300.00 | $1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 NO BID
2 640Z CONTAINERS/CASE, OR EQUAL
BG. 40|BAG SCOTTS, HIGH K FERTILIZER PLUS, TURF $ 52.80 $ 2'112_00 $ 27112_00 NO BID NO BID
ENHANCER 15-0-29, OR EQUAL
SIGNED:| _ YES YES YES
IN-STATE PREFERENCE:[ __NO NO YES 93R17
PAYMENT TERMS:| _ NET 30 NET 30 NET 30
DELIVERY: _ 30 CAL DAYS 7-14 CAL DAYS 5 CAL DAYS
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED:| _ YES 2 &3 OF 3ACK 1 OF 3 ACK

*  exceptions to unit of measure *  exceptions to unit of measure *  exceptions to unit of measure



